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ITEM / DESCRIPTION Quantity Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case

AIRWAY MANAGEMENT

Bag-Valve-Mask Disposable  Bag Easy

Adult with PEEP 250 ct $75.70Case 6 $18.55EA 1 $9.84ea $73.32 Case 6 $223.15Case 12 $299.05CS 6

Child 60 ct $58.88Case 6 $18.55EA 1 $13.59ea $67.30 Case 6 $353.80Box 6 $336.33CS 12

Infant 60 ct $50.00Case 6 $18.55EA 1 $13.35ea $124.43 Case 12 $279.45Box 6 $336.33CS 12

CPAP

O2 Resq Bitrac Ed Full Face Mask & Head Strap, Adult Medium 20 ea $36.52Each 10 $47.13EA 1 $37.11ea $318.25Box 10 $297.34CS 10

O2 Resq Bitrac Ed Full Face Mask & Head Strap, Adult Large with capno line & flow generator 75 ea $36.52Each 10 $46.99EA 1 $38.99ea $630.40Case 10 $297.34CS 10

O2 Resq Bitrac Max Shield, Regular Adult 75 ea $293.10Case 10 $31.25EA 1 $38.99ea $615.00Case 10

O2 Resq Bitrac Max Shield, Small Adult 20 ea $293.10Case 10 $31.25EA 1No Bid $615.00Case 10 $297.34CS 10

Endotracheal Tube Introducer Adult w/Coude Tip, 15FR (Bougie) 50 ea $3.00Each 10 $4.13EA 1 $2.86ea $58.78 Box 10 $97.50Each 1 $75.93BX 10

Endotracheal Tube Introducer Pediatric 10 FR x 70 CM w/Coude Tip 36 ea $3.00Each 10 $4.13EA 1 $2.86ea $58.78 Box 10 $168.00Box 10 $75.93BX 10

Endotracheal tubes (cuffed with stylette)

8.5 30 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

8.0 30 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

7.5 50 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

7.0 30 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

6.5 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

6.0 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

5.5 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

5.0 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $16.00 Box 10 $31.40Box 10 $74.77BX 10

4.5 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $31.40Box 10

4.0 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $1.18ea $31.40Box 10

3.5 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $3.12ea $31.40Box 10

3.0 20 ct. $13.30Box 10 $1.48EA 1 $3.12ea $31.40Box 10

2.5 20 ct. $1.50Each 10 $1.48EA 1No Bid $27.50Box 10

2.0 20 ct. $1.50Each 10 $0.48EA 1No Bid $21.00Box 10

French Suction Catheters – various sizes

#5 French 20ctNo Bid $0.47EA 1 $0.73ea $45.90Case 50 $118.93CS 10

#6 French 20 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $6.76ea $0.62 Each 1 $30.75Case 50 $118.93CS 10

#8 French 20 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $6.76ea $0.73 Each 1 $35.70Case 50 $118.93CS 10

#10 French 20 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $1.95ea 0.44Each 1 $42.50Case 50 $554.06CS 20

#12 French 30 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $1.95ea $0.43 Each 1 $33.85Case 50 $98.14CS 10

#14 French 40 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $1.95ea $0.62 Each 1 $32.75Case 50 $98.14CS 10

#16 French 20 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $1.95ea 0.96Each 1 $37.40Case 50 $554.06CS 20

#18 French 20 ct. $0.17Each 50 $0.12EA 1 $1.95ea 0.62Each 1 $29.55Case 50

King LT-D Supraglottic Airway Kit

Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size O, pediatric 10 ea $36.55Each 5 $32.00EA 1 $32.74ea $202.96 Case 5 $66.95Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size 1, pediatric 10 ea $36.55Each 5 $32.00EA 1 $32.74ea $202.96 Case 5 $69.40Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size 2, pediatric, 35-45 in., tube, 35 cc syringe, lube jelly 25 ea $36.55Each 5 $30.79EA 1 $32.74ea $202.96 Case 5 $74.50Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, LT-D, size 2.5, pediatric 41-51 in., tube, 35 cc syringe, lube jelly 25 ea $36.55Each 5 $30.79EA 1 $38.10ea $202.96 Case 5 $69.45Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, KING LTS-D, yellow, size 3, adult 4-5 ft, double lumen tube 25 ea $33.33Each 5 $30.79EA 1 $35.71ea $191.02 Case 5 $95.50Each 1 $39.38CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, KING LTS-D, red, size 4, adult 5-6 ft, 60cc syringe, lube jelly 50 ea $33.33Each 5 $30.79EA 1 $35.71ea $191.02 Case 5 $114.40Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Supraglottic airway kit, KING LTS-D, purple, size 5, adult over 6 ft, 60cc syringe, lube 50 ea $33.33Each 5 $30.79EA 1 $35.71ea $191.02 Case 5 $114.40Each 1 $39.68CS 5

Laryngoscope Blades - (Greenline) Disposable Fiberoptic

Macintosh #0 15 ct.No Bid $4.77EA 1 $1.79ea $44.61 Case 10 $439.70Case 6 $57.63CS 10

#1 15 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $57.63CS 10

#2 15 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $59.83CS 10

#3 50 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $40.99 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $58.44CS 10

#4 50 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $40.99 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $61.08CS 10

Miller #0 15 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $44.61 Case 10 $73.30Each 1 $57.63CS 10

#1 15 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $59.83CS 10

#2 15 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $59.83CS 10

#3 50 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $59.83CS 10

#4 50 ct. $3.27Each 20 $3.75EA 1 $1.79ea $41.38 Case 10 $65.10Each 1 $57.63CS 10

McGrath Video Laryngoscope Supplies

McGRATH® 3.6V EMS Battery 2 ct No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.82 Each 1 $3.65Pack 1 $50.03EA 1

McGRATH® MAC 3 Disposable Laryngoscope Blade 20 ct No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.15 Each 1 $65.10Each 1 $815.07BX 50

McGRATH® MAC 4 Disposable Laryngoscope Blade 20 ct No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.15 Each 1 $65.10Each 1 $815.07BX 50

Laryngoscope Handles (Greenline) Fiberoptic

Large Handle (C-Cell) Fiber Optic 5 ct. $31.75Each $46.25EA 1 $31.33ea $82.00 Each 1 $17.00Each 1 $93.93EA 1

Small Handle (AA-cell) 5 ct. $30.83Each $8.98EA 1 $31.33ea $99.24 Each 1 $12.00Each 1 $128.20EA 1

Microstream Smart Capnoline LP12 & 15 compatible

ETT Adapter Smart Capnoline 200 ea $6.05Each 25 $7.45EA 1 $6.99ea $332.92 Case 25 $522.85Case 25

Nasal Canula Smart Capnoline (With oxygen tubing included) 500 ct $5.29Each 25 $8.45EA 1 $6.99ea $198.95 Case 25 $22.70Each 1

Nasopharyngeal Airways (NPA) (Rusch)

20 fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $96.86BX 10

22 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $1.98ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.57BX 10

24 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.80BX 10

26 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.86BX 10

28 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $3.86ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.63BX 10

30 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.78BX 10

32 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $1.86ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.98BX 10

34 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $96.08BX 10

36 Fr. 20 ea $1.51Each 10 $1.60EA 1 $2.38ea $71.00Kit 9 $95.25BX 10

Oropharyngeal Airways (OPA) (Berman)

Infant 40mm 20 ct. $0.15Each 100 $0.20EA 1 $0.22ea $6.24 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Infant 50mm 20 ct. $0.14Each 50 $0.15EA 1 $0.22ea $3.71 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Small Child 60mm 20 ct. $0.14Each 100 $0.15EA 1 $0.23ea $3.57 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Large Child 70mm 20 ct. $0.15Each 50 $0.15EA 1 $0.22ea $3.62 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6

Small Adult 80mm  40 ct. $0.14Each 100 $0.15EA 1 $0.22ea $6.24 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Medium Adult 90mm 50 ct. $0.14Each 100 $0.15EA 1 $0.22ea $2.85 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Large Adult 100mm  50 ct. $0.14Each 100 $0.15EA 1 $0.22ea $3.10 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6 $5.12BX 12

Extra Large Adult 110mm 50 ct $0.14Each 100 $0.20EA 1 $0.22ea $6.24 Box 12 $4.95Kit 6

Oxygen Supplies

Adult Nasal Cannula 2000 ct $16.81Case 50 $0.24EA 1 $0.38ea $13.20 Case 50 $0.75Each 1 $67.14CS 50

Adult Non-rebreather Oxygen Masks 1500 ct $0.68Each 50 $0.69EA 1 $0.65ea $40.66 Case 50 $1.65Each 1 $112.39CS 50

Aquapak Sterile Water Prefilled Humidifiers 10 ea. $34.20Case 20 $1.31EA 1No Bid $2.25Each 1 $69.18CS 20

Bag Assist Nebulizer Kit, includes Medic-Aid High-Speed, Side Stream Nebulizer 60 ctNo Bid $5.90EA 1 $12.50ea $1.95Each 1 $563.04CS 50

Nebulizer set with T Adapter (Hudson Micromist) 400 ct. $0.83Each 50 $0.73EA 1 $1.06ea $1.70Each 1 $84.50CS 50

Oxygen Supply Tubing (7ft) 300 ct $0.28Each 50 $0.25EA 1 $0.22ea $0.65Each 1 $27.42CS 50

Pediatric Nasal Cannula 200 ct. $19.33Case 50 $0.24EA 1 $0.30ea $34.87 Case 50 $1.95Each 1 $95.14CS 50

Pediatric Non rebreather Oxygen Masks 200 ct. $1.11Each 50 $38.90CS 50 $0.78ea $71.37 Case 50 $1.40Each 1 $162.21CS 50

Pocket Masks w/ O2 Port and Case 200 ct. $3.35Each 100 $2.45EA 1 $3.35ea $10.50Each 1 $8.87EA 1

Tracheostomy Mask, 6inch Flextube, 6 Diluter Jets, Humidification Hood, 7 foot Tubing, Adult 25 ea.No Bid $4.10EA 1 $0.99ea $2.90Each 1

Oxygen Tanks and Accessories

"M" size O2 Cylinders 1 ct. $252.32Each $39.99EA 1No Bid $100.00Each 1 $411.69EA 1

“C” size Aluminum O2 Cylinders 10 ct. $68.20Each $56.99EA 1No Bid $66.85Each 1 $356.40EA 1

“D” size Aluminum O2 Cylinders 20 ct $62.98Each $54.36EA 1 $64.04ea $105.75Each 1 $363.29EA 1

Oxygen Coupler, DISS female 3 ct. $39.63Each $41.99EA 1No Bid $54.65Each 1 $52.23EA 1

Oxygen Coupler, DISS Male 3 ct. $32.24Each $35.99EA 1No Bid $55.70Each 1 $53.39EA 1

Oxygen Hose Assembly, DISS Female Hex Nut Fitting, 6ft L 3 ct.No Bid $29.49EA 1No Bid $45.90Each 1 $43.99EA 1

Oxygen Regulator, 0 to 25lpm, Barb and 2 DISS Power Take-offs 10 ct. $24.94Each $29.95EA 1 $29.42ea $85.00Each 1

Oxygen wrench 50 ct. $1.14 $0.25EA 1 $0.31ea $1.95Each 1 $1.35EA 1

Plastic Barbed Fitting Attachment For Oxygen Hose 25 ea. $22.69Case 50 $0.49EA 1 $0.38ea $14.00Each 1 $32.37BX 50

Post Valve, Seal Protector, Pull Type 500 ea.No Bid $0.19EA 1 $64.41Case 1000cs $41.00Bag 100 $42.08BG 100

Stat-O-Seal Cylinder Gasket, Brass With Rubber Center 100 ea. $0.52Each 50 $0.99EA 1 $0.56ea $11.90Pack 5 $8.26PK 5

Suction Accessories

General Purpose Syringe, 50 to 60cc Toomey 10 ea $29.06Box 20 $0.47EA 1 $32.47bx 20bx $2.60Each 1 $67.24CS 50

BATTERY ALKALINE FOR SSCOR QUICKDRAW 2403 10 ct. $23.86Each $494.99EA 1 $22.44ea $8.00Pack 24 $0.68EA 1

DuCanto Suction Catheter 100 ea $1.79Each 50 $2.10EA 1 $3.25ea $3.55Each 1 $144.37CS 50

Lubricating jelly 5 bx. $4.98Box 144 $0.20EA 1 $8.93bx 144bx $8.00Box 144 $11.32BX 144

QUICKDRAW RECHARGABLE 12V SEALED LEAD ACID 2 ct.No Bid $65.99EA 1No Bid $49.35Each 1 $39.22EA 1

Salem Sump™ Dual Lumen Stomach Tube, 16fr x 48in L 10 ea $1.74Each 50 $2.11EA 1No Bid $2.60Each 1 $8.80EA 1

SSCOR QuickDraw Canister w/Suction Tubing Attached 24 ea $231.84Case 15 $15.99EA 1No Bid $28.20Each 1 $474.44CS 15

Suction Canisters Disposable Rigid Green Top (1200cc) 150 ct. $2.63Each 48 $6.49EA 1 $2.72ea $3.95Each 1 $225.80CS 48

Suction Tubing (1/4in x 6ft) 125 ct. $28.88Case 50 $0.86EA 1 $0.95ea $3.70Each 1 $40.63CS 50

Yankauer Rigid Suction Catheter 25 ct. $0.34Each 50 $0.44EA 1 $1.79ea $4.45Each 1 $39.62CS 50

Tube Holders

 Adult size ETT Holders (Thomas) 75 ct $2.72Each 100 $2.70EA 1 $3.27ea $3.50Each 1 $5.12EA 1

 Peds size ETT Holders (Thomas) 20 ct $2.72Each 100 $2.70EA 1 $3.86ea $2.75Each 1 $6.04EA 1

Ventilator Supplies

Ventilation Circuit Valve w/12 in hose, Allied Healthcare Autovent 30 ea $6.40Each 10 $7.65EA 1No Bid $210.00Case 10 $113.02CS 10

AHP300 Vent Circuit, Adult 10 ea $96.59Case 10 $102.15CS 10 $10.12ea $5.90Each 1 $146.65CA 10

AHP300 Vent Circuit, Pediatric 5 ea $204.55Case 20 $215.46CS 20 $10.12ea $31.70Box 5 $353.04CS 20

Closed Suction Catheter, Double Swivel Elbow, 14 French, Adult 10eaNo Bid $0.19EA 1No Bid $14.00Each 1 $98.14CS 10

Disposable PEEP Valve, 0-20cm, with 22mm Adaptor 20 ea $2.89Each 20 $3.15EA 1 $3.05ea $45.30Case 12 $6.70EA 1

Gibeck® Iso-Gard® HEPA Light Filter 50 eaNo Bid $4.06EA 1No Bid $225.60Case 20 $178.85CS 20

Revel Ventilator Circuit Kit with HME, Adult 30 eaNo Bid $29.79EA 1No Bid $1.95Each 1 $300.31CS 10

BAGS

Hard Collar / Kendrick Extrication Device Carry Case, 38 1/2inch L x 13inch H 5 ctNo Bid $28.28EA 1 $42.73ea $108.95Each 1 $85.74EA 1

LA Rescue Cervical Collar Bag, Reflective Trim, 24inch L x 11inch T x 5inch W 5 ct $18.12Each $27.29EA 1 $25.64ea $32.50Each 1 $46.56EA 1

Maxpedition FATTY POCKET ORGANIZER 5 ctNo Bid $17.79EA 1No Bid $44.00Each 1

Medstorm Intubation Module 400, Royal 5 ctNo Bid $135.99EA 1No Bid $80.75Each 1

Medstorm S600 IV Module, Red 5 ctNo Bid $52.99EA 1No Bid $173.00Each 1

Oxygen/Trauma/Airway Deployment Kit, 23inch L x 6 1/2inch W x 14 1/4inch D, Blue 5 ct $127.77Each $330.72EA 1 $116.67ea $568.80Each 1 $118.15EA 1

StatPacks G1 Pharmacy Module, Fold Away, 6inch x 8inch x 10 1/2inch, Black 1 ct $62.73Each $71.99EA 1 $67.32ea $110.50Each $92.56EA 1

Statpacks G3 Responder 1 ct $224.32Each $259.99EA 1 $240.73ea $395.00Each 1 $331.02EA 1

CARDIAC MONITOR AND DEFIBRILLATIONS SUPPLIES

ECG Electrodes - BlueSensor Electrodes AMBU, INC. 650 pk. $9.44Pack 50 $9.45PK 50 $12.46pk 50pk $20.30Pack 10 $10.20PK 60

ECG Electrodes- Kendall™ Medi-Trace® 135  Pediatric, 1-1/4in Diameter Size 50 pk. $119.83Case 600 $0.68PK 5 $1.05pch 5pch $1.55Pack 5 $1.50PK 5

EKG PAPER 100MM FOR LP15 175 ea $8.31Box 5 $1.66RL 1 $1.58ea $19.45 Case 2 Rolls $32.15Roll 1 $16.26BX 5

Lifepak 15  12-Lead ECG Cable Trunk Cable with 4-Wire Limb Leads 5ft 4 ct $312.35Each $329.98EA 1 $349.49ea $344.95 Each 1 $487.80Each 1 $318.32EA 1

Lifepak 15 12-Lead ECG Cable 6-Wire Precordial Attachment 4 ct $125.90Each $133.54EA 1 $140.87ea $139.95 Each 1 $196.60Each 1 $188.37EA 1

Lifepak 15 Back Pouch 1 ct $69.20Each $77.99EA 1 $82.54ea $76.95 Each 1 $118.00Each 1 $103.72EA 1

Lifepak 15 Esophageal-Rectal Temperature Sensor (20/Box) 1 bx $181.55Box 20 $6.70EA 1 $78.47ea $132.95 Each 1 $24.60Each 1 $174.29BX 20

Lifepak 15 Lithium-ion Battery 5.7 Ah 15 ct $392.95Each $422.99EA 1 $468.67ea $434.95 Each 1 $678.00Each 1 $606.25EA 1

Lifepak 15 LNCS Rainbow Reusable Sensor (Adult) 10 ct $596.69Each $579.99EA 1 $673.08ea $564.95 Each 1 $446.85Each 1 $763.01EA 1

Lifepak 15 Masimo rainbow RC-4 EMS Patient Cable 10 ct $232.95Each $93.99EA 1 $90.36ea $198.95 Each 1 $133.20Each 1 $268.25EA 1

Lifepak 15 Mobile Battery Charger 1 ct $1,698.30Each $92.99EA 1No Bid $1,884.95 Each 1 $2,447.90Each 1 $2,405.92EA 1

Lifepak 15 NIBP Tubing- 2-9ft Coiled 4 ct $75.57Each $87.99EA 1 $85.73ea $83.95 Each 1 $124.10Each 1 $113.25EA 1

Lifepak 15 NIBP Tubing- 9ft Straight 4 ct $66.02Each $76.99EA 1No Bid $72.95 Each 1 $194.10Each 1 $98.96EA 1

Lifepak 15 QUIK-COMBO Therapy Cable 2 ct $324.55Each $382.99EA 1 $368.20ea $359.95 Each 1 $507.60Each 1 $486.43EA 1

Lifepak 15 Reusable Cuff Adult 26 - 35 cm 4 ct $25.45Each $29.49EA 1 $24.56ea $27.95 Each 1 $39.80Each 1 $38.15EA 1

Lifepak 15 Reusable Cuff Infant 8 - 14 cm 4 ct $18.30Each $21.49EA 1 $22.74ea $9.45 Each 1 $37.11Each 1 $27.42EA 1

Lifepak 15 Reusable Cuff Pediatric 13 - 20 cm 4 ct $20.68Each $22.49EA 1 $25.16ea $22.95 Each 1 $40.76Each 1 $30.99EA 1

Lifepak 15 Reusable Cuff X-Large Adult 35 x 44 cm 4 ct $40.57Each $44.99EA 1 $30.53ea $44.95 Each 1 $71.85Each 1 $60.80EA 1

Lifepak 15 Shoulder Strap 2 ct $31.82Each $35.99EA 1 $37.95ea $34.95 Each 1 $53.32Each 1 $47.69EA 1

Lifepak 15 Skin Temperature Sensor (20/box) 4 bx $111.99Box 20 $6.19EA 1No Bid $124.95 Each 1 $20.00Each 1 $18.34BX 20

Lifepak 15 Standard Carrying Case 2 ct $268.07Each $332.99EA 1 $319.72ea $297.95 Each 1 $454.88Each 1 $401.78EA 1

Lifepak 15 Temperature Adapter Cable- 5 ft 2 ct $304.14Each $328.30EA 1No Bid $340.40 Each 1 $94.70Each 1 $455.42EA 1

Lifepak 15 Top Pouch 2 ct $48.52Each $62.99EA 1 $57.87ea $53.95 Each 1 $75.90Each 1 $72.73EA 1

Lifepak CHARGE-PAK™ Charging Unit & 1 QUIK-PAK™ Electrodes 25 ct $84.52Each $122.99EA 1No Bid $96.95 Each 1 $122.00Each 1 $106.41EA 1

LIFEPAK CR2 AED Lithium Battery 2 ct $198.86Each $1.53EA 1No Bid $219.95 Each 1 $326.50Each 1 $298.06EA 1

LIFEPAK CR2 Carrying Case 2 ct $69.20Each $344.99EA 1No Bid $76.95 Each 1 $108.25Each 1 $103.72EA 1

LIFEPAK CR2 Carrying Case 2 ct $69.20Each $344.99EA 1No Bid $76.95 Each 1 $108.25Each 1 $103.72EA 1

LIFEPAK CR2 Replacement Handle 2 ctNo Bid $107.00EA 1No Bid $21.95 Each 1 $31.10Each 1 $29.81EA 1

LIFEPAK CR2 Replacement Lid 2 ctNo Bid No Bid No Bid $63.45 Each 1 $27.40Each 1 $85.84EA 1

LP 15 Multi-Function Defib Pads, Physio-Control Adult $15.63Pair 10 $15.37PR 1 $14.29pr 1pr $28.95 Each 1 $48.55Each 1 $32.56EA 1

LP 15 Multi-Function Defib Pads, Physio-Control Pediatric $15.63Pair 10 $17.12PR 1 $14.29pr 1pr $83.45 Each 1 $58.15Each 1 $102.63EA 1

Masimo M-LNCS Adult Single Patient Use Adhesive SpO2 only Sensor. Box of 20 4 bx $243.88Box 20 $14.42EA 1 $14.88ea $284.95 Each 1 $342.00Box 20 $386.27BX 20

Masimo M-LNCS Pediatric Single Patient Use Adhesive SpO2 only Sensor. Box of 20 4 bx $241.68Box 20 $19.12EA 1 $13.69ea $299.95 Each 1 $339.10Box 20 $410.42BX 20

QUIK-STEP™ pacing/ECG/defibrillation electrodes 2 ct $111.23Each 1 No Bid No Bid $126.95 Each 1 $496.80Case 20 $253.75EA 1

DRESSING AND BANDAGING SUPPLIES

HyFin Vent Chest Seal, Twin Pack 5 ea. $11.49Each $14.11PK 2 $13.18ea $12.78Each Each $17.25Each 1 $19.23PK 2

Band-aid adhesive bandage 1in x 3 in 5 bx $1.37Box 100 $4.39BX 100 $2.56bx 50bx $1.99Case 2400 $2.25Box 100 $7.00BX 100

Cohesive Elastic Bandage, 3in 100 ea $0.64Each 144 $15.29BX 24 $3.12bx 10bx $31.43Case 24 $21.75Case 24 $63.18CS 24

Foil Baby Bunting 5 ea. $1.95Each $4.84EA 1 $2.24ea $5.41Each Each $7.50Each 1 $7.19EA 1

H-Bandage Trauma Dressing, Flat Fold, Sterile 10 ea.No Bid $6.28EA 1 $3.92ea $7.81Each Each $11.45Each 1 $10.38EA 1

Self Care Basic Trauma Kit, Olive Drab 5 ct.No Bid $19.90EA 1 $42.65ea $93.68Each Each $70.75Case 12

Sterile Burn Sheets (60 x 96 or similar) 10 ct. $1.76Each 50 $2.02EA 1 $1.54ea $57.20Case 12 $44.48CS 12

Sterile OB Kits 10 ct. $4.71Each 10 $6.43EA 1 $4.94ea $16.54Each Each $8.00Each 1 $15.87EA 1

Sterile Trauma Dressings 10 ct. $0.63Each 25 $0.94EA 1 $0.71ea $76.95Case 25 $1.50Pack 1 $50.58CS 50

Triangular Bandages (12/bx) 50 bx. $0.19Each 240 $4.42PK 12 $3.49pk 12pk $3.80Case 72 $6.90Box 12 $6.23BX 12

Tape:

1" x 10 yards Roll Porous Adhesive Tape (12/bx) 5 bx $5.35Box 12 $8.03BX 12 $3.82bx 12bx $10.72Case 12 $5.80Box 12 $12.54BX 12

1" x 10yds Roll Cloth Adhesive Tape (4/bx) 5 bx $8.03Box 12 $8.44BX 12 $6.33bx 12bx $4.83Case 24 $17.70Box 8 $20.70BX 12

1/2" x 10 yards Roll Porous Adhesive Tape (24/bx) 25 bx. $5.35Box 24 $9.41BX 24 $3.82bx 24bx $21.85Case 24 $15.60Box 24 $21.37BX 24

2" x 10 yards Roll Cloth Adhesive Tape (6/bx) 5 bx $8.03Box 6 $8.47BX 6 $6.33bx 6bx $17.68Case 6 $5.35Box 6 $19.11BX 6

2" x 10 yards Roll Porous Adhesive Tape (6/bx) 5 bx $5.35Box 6 $8.03BX 6 $3.82bx 6bx $14.26Case 6 $5.35Box 6 $18.40BX 6

3" x 10 yards Roll Cloth Adhesive Tape (12/bx) 5 bx $8.03Box 4 $8.49BX 4 $6.33bx 4bx various $9.30Box 4 $14.47BX 4

3" x 10 yards Roll Porous Adhesive Tape (4/bx) 5 bx $6.22Box 4 $11.08BX 4 $3.82bx 4bx $12.32Case 4 $6.60Box 4 $12.90BX 4

Rolled Gauze bandages

2" x 4.1 yards Sterile Gauze Roll (12/box) 20 bx $1.43Pack 12 $2.68BG 12 $1.32bx 12bx $6.29Case 96 $3.40Bag 12 $6.68BX 12

3" x 4.1 yards Sterile Gauze Roll (12/box) 20 bx $1.89Pack 12 $3.35BG 12 $1.69bx 12bx $7.54Case 96 $1.95Bag 12 $5.89BX 12

4" x 4.1 yards Sterile Gauze Roll (12/box) 20 bx $2.54Pack 12 $3.50BG 12 $1.64bx 12bx $8.86Case 96 $2.15Bag 12 $6.64BX 12

Gauze Pads / Dressings

2" x 2" Sterile Gauze Pad (1 pad per pkg, 100pkg/bx) 50 bx. $1.92Box 100 $2.52BX 100 $1.39bx 100bx $4.75Box 100 $15.64BX 100

2" x 2" Sterile Gauze Pad (2 pad per pkg, 50pkg/bx) 25 bx. $31.28Case 3000 $1.53TR 100 $0.83bx 50bx $5.15Box 100 $15.64BX 100

4" x 4" Sterile Gauze Pad (100/bx) 25 bx. $4.85Box 100 $5.82BX 100 $1.29bx 25bx $4.90Box 50 $27.37BX 100

5"x 9" Sterile Gauze Pad (25/box) 25 bx. $1.57Box 20 $2.19TR 25 $1.90bx 20bx $2.65Box 20 $3.24BX 25

8" x 10" Sterile Dressing 25 bx. $3.07Pack 24 $3.62TR 20 $4.01bx 24bx $4.90Box 24 $2.86BX 16

Coflex compression dressing - Olive Drab 10 ea. $277.77Case 100 $0.87EA 1 $6.02ea $5.95Each 1 $15.63BC 2

Israeli Compression Emergency Bandage, 6inch W, Olive Drab 10 ea. $163.88Case 50 $6.71EA 1 $6.42ea $9.18Each 1 $9.37EA 1

Multi-Trauma Dressing 10"/12" x 30" 50 ea. $0.63Each 25 $1.14EA 1 $0.71ea $55.40Case 25 $93.92CS 50

QuikClot Combat Gauze LE Z-Fold 20 ea. $32.06Each 50 $35.77EA 1 $50.15Each 1 $65.87EA 1

IMMOBILIZATION & PATIENT MOVEMENT SUPPLIES / EQUIPMENT

Fracture Pack - Complete splint kit 10 ea $94.18Each $170.13EA 1 $103.22ea $235.65Each 1 $162.47EA 1

Hare Traction Splint 5 ea $136.67Each $19.84EA 1 $332.91ea $122.00Each 1 $268.02EA 1

Slishman Traction Splint 5 ea $112.68Each $158.87EA 1 $179.84ea $239.00Each 1 $218.02EA 1

Kendrick Extrication Device (or equivalent) 5 ea $47.65Each $51.99EA 1 $51.22ea $108.95Each 1 $85.74EA 1

Stryker Power Pro XT

Stryker Defibrillator Platform 2 ea.No Bid No Bid No Bid $721.70Each 1 $691.60EA 1

Stryker Power Pro cot with XPS 2 ea.No Bid No Bid No Bid $3,702.00Each 1

Stryker Pro Stair Chair with track 2 ea.No Bid No Bid No Bid

Backrest Storage Pouch 1 eaNo Bid $75.33EA 1No Bid

Head-End Storage Flat 1 eaNo Bid $133.00EA 1No Bid

XPS G-Rated Bolster Mattress 1 eaNo Bid $497.99EA 1No Bid $658.25EA 1

Leg Restraints 1 eaNo Bid $63.99EA 1No Bid

Shoulder Restraint 1 eaNo Bid $39.19EA 1No Bid

SMRT Battery Pak 1 eaNo Bid $509.99EA 1No Bid

Waist Restraint 1 eaNo Bid $119.00EA 1No Bid

X Restraints 1 eaNo Bid $119.00EA 1No Bid $43.18EA 1

Splints

3" x 15" padded board splint 20 ct. $1.50Each $2.37EA 1 $2.50ea $3.45Each 1 $3.30EA 1

3" x 36" padded board splint 10 ct. $2.89Each $4.03EA 1 $4.79ea $4.45Each 1 $5.67EA 1

3" x 54" padded board splint 10 ct. $3.61Each $5.45EA 1 $6.43ea $7.55Each 1 $7.61EA 1

Padded cardboard splints various sizes 20 ct. $26.06Each $1.36EA 1 $41.14pk $4.00Each $2.77EA 1

SAM splint 20 ct. $3.00Each 50 $7.15EA 1 $2.98ea $12.85Each 1 $11.33EA 1

Backboards and Accessories

Backboard restraint straps - speed clips (male/female seatbelt buckle) 30 sets $8.27Each $10.78EA 1 $8.61ea $18.90Each 1 $13.97EA 1

Backboards (Poly) w/ pins 10 ea $118.57Each $88.34EA 1 $145.56ea $159.00Each 1 $224.49EA 1

Disposable Head immobilization devices 50 ct. $3.33Each 10 $2.98ST 1 $3.37ea $6.45Each 1 $5.15EA 1

Ferno Pedi-mate 5 ea. $307.47Each $298.90EA 1 $361.91ea $487.80Each 1 $417.23EA 1

Ferno Pedi-pac 5 ea. $361.14Each $363.40EA 1 $436.54ea $644.75Each 1 $573.05EA 1

Folding Backboard w/ pins 2 ct $292.09 $88.34EA 1No Bid $129.00Each 1 $384.55EA 1

BID FORM FOR MEDICAL SUPPLIES

The entire bid form must be completed.  Please indicate N/A when a product is not available.

ALL BIDS SUBMITTED TABULATION
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Annual Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity Case or Quantity

ITEM / DESCRIPTION Quantity Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case Bid Price Each Per Case

Megamover Style 1500 Transport Unit 40x80 Nonwoven Poly White 1500 lb Capacity, 14
handles 36 ea $133.30Case 10 $17.75EA 1 $15.38ea $23.75Each 1 $232.24CS 10

Megamover Transport Chair, Nonwoven Poly, 35x35 White, 8 handles, 350 lb Capacity 24 ea $135.25Case 10 $16.15EA 1 $15.60ea $213.00Each 1 $202.77CS 10

Multi-Grip Head immobilizer 100 ct. $4.34Each 50 $3.20EA 1 $4.22ea $375.00Case 50 $317.23CS 50

Reeve Sleeve, 73inch x 24inch, Orange, incl Head Blocks, Head/Chin Straps, Case 5 ea. $726.14Each $551.29EA 1No Bid $1,020.00Each 1 $1,006.55EA 1

Scoop stretcher 5 ea. $417.20Each $202.00EA 1 $366.67ea $593.00Each 1 $558.47EA 1

Sked  Rescue Sled 5 ea.No Bid $596.80EA 1 $809.93ea $394.00Each 1 $707.68EA 1

Stokes basket 5 ea. $820.91 $239.00EA 1No Bid $535.00Each 1 $1,487.73EA 1

Tomcat CID 125 ct.No Bid No Bid No Bid $143.00Each 1

Extrication Collars (Stifneck)

Adult Adjustable 500 ct $5.21Each 50 $5.08EA 1 $5.77ea $9.10Each 1 $8.07EA 1

Pediatric Adjustable 200 ct $5.21Each 20 $5.08EA 1 $5.42ea $8.85Each 1 $8.27EA 1

INFECTION CONTROL:

3M N95 Respirators flat fold 25 box $532.85Case 440 $0.77EA 1No Bid $40.00Box 50 $552.00CS 440

Biohazard Waste Bag, 1.5 mil, Red w/Black Print, 17inch x 17inch, 40gallon 100 ea. $86.47Case 250 $45.89CS 200 $91.94cs 250cs $64.54Case 200 $71.00Case 100 $78.57CS 100

Biohazard Waste Bag, 1.5 mil, Red w/Black Print, 17inch x 17inch, 4gallon 100 ea. $1.92Roll 20 $0.11EA 1 $0.14ea $51.01Case 50 $36.50Case 1000 $6.12BX 50

Brutab 6S Disinfectant Tablets 5 casesNo Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25Case 300 $247.00CS 1200

Disinfectant Wipes 100 ct $6.65Pack 80 $22.85BX 50No Bid $0.022Each 1,200 $60.46Case 1920 $250.00 $2.50 $125.00 $6.40Can 160 $148.81CS 12

Disinfectant and Air Sanitizer Spray Can, 16 oz. Staphene 12 boxNo Bid $4.15EA 1No Bid $70.38Case 12 $74.50Case 12 $101.67CS 12

Disposable Fluid Resistent Gown 500 ea $12.20Bag 10 $2.00EA 1No Bid $1.900Each 100 $39.94Case 10 $0.318Case 500 $111.00Case 75 $179.40CS 200

Reusuable Fluid resistent Gown 100 eaNo Bid $2.00EA 1No Bid $24.48Each Each $73.50Case 12 $246.36CS 12

Fluid-resistant disposable fitted sheet (73x21x30) (6 per pk) 100 ct $68.96Case 50 $35.25CS 50No Bid $72.59Case 50 $100.00Case 50 $12.09BG 10

Fluidshield Fog Free Mask, with Wraparound Splashguard Visor, Pleat Style, 10 box $23.19Box 25 $29.50BX 25 $27.11bx 25bx $210.55Case 50 $32.48BX 25

Gown, Isolation X-Large 100 eaNo Bid $2.00EA 1No Bid $1.300 100 $15.97Case 100 $175.00 $1.75 $87.50 $49.00Case 50 $179.40CS 200

Hand Sanitizer 1 qt bottles 50 eaNo Bid $5.12EA 1No Bid $89.32Case 4 $199.50 $3.99 $199.50 $165.00Case 12 $125.68CS 6

Hand Sanitizer 2 oz bottles 150 eaNo Bid $2.11EA 1 $0.61ea $67.19Case 48 $100.50 $0.67 $67.00 $50.25Case 24 $55.20CS 48

Hydrogen Peroxide 16oz bottle 5 ea $0.46Each 12 $1.16EA 1 $0.59ea $8.74Case 12 $1.00Each 1 $0.99EA 1

N95- 3M 1870/1870+ 10 boxes $532.85Case 440 $29.25BX 20No Bid $114.43Case 20 $552.00CS 440

N95- 3M 8210 5 boxes $14.53Box 20 $17.15BX 20No Bid $45.43Case 20 $116.15CS 160

N95- 3M1860 5 boxes $16.40Box 20 $19.20BX 20No Bid $79.93Case 20 $26.40BX 20

Nemesis V30 Safety Glasses 50 ea $3.81Each 12 $4.10EA 1No Bid $5.60Each $7.25Each 1 $6.76EA 1

O&M Halyard FLUIDSHIELD N95 Particulate Filter Respirator And Surgical Mask, Regular Size15 boxes $49.72Box 35 $30.49BX 35 $75.00bx 35bx $25.38Case 200 $110.80Box 35 $44.02BX 35

PAWS Handwipes Antimicrobial Individaully Wrapped Fresh Scent 15 box $3.85Box 100 $4.92BX 100No Bid $28.05Case 100 $6.45Box 100 $116.91CS 12

PDI Germididal Wipes XL Individual Foil Pack 11.5" x 11.75", Super Sani-Cloth 12 box $20.40Box 50 $22.85BX 50No Bid $154.33Case 150 $25.20Sleeve 50 $27.40BX 50

SaniZide Plus Disinfectant/Deodorizer, Bottle, 1gallon 10 ea. $16.25Each 4 $17.90EA 1No Bid $75.01Case 4 $23.00Each 1 $26.08EA 1

Surgical Masks 150 box $10.36Box 50 $19.49CS 300 $75.00bx 35bx $0.060Each 2,000 $109.25Case 300 $750.00 $5.00 $250.00 $5.830Case 150 $40.00Box 25 $10.24BX 50

Surgical Masks with Faceshield 4 boxes $22.92Box 25 $15.49BX 25 $27.11bx 25bx $79.93Case 300 $32.55Box 25 $20.88BX 25

Gloves:

Glove case - nylon - for belt 50 ea. $3.63Each $2.59EA 1 $3.67ea $23.65Pair 1

Microflex Midknight Gloves - Nitrile/Powder Free, Size L Black 30 box $18.68Box/100 10 boxes $18.74BX 100No Bid $22.00Box 100

Microflex Midknight Gloves - Nitrile/Powder Free, Size M Black 30 box $18.68Box/100 10 boxes $18.74BX 100No Bid $22.00Box 100

Microflex Midknight Gloves - Nitrile/Powder Free, Size S Black 30 box $18.68Box/100 10 boxes $18.74BX 100No Bid $22.00Box 100

Microflex Midknight Gloves - Nitrile/Powder Free, Size XL Black 30 box $18.68Box/100 10 boxes $18.74BX 100No Bid $22.00Box 100

NeoPro EC Gloves, Chloroprene, Powder Free,  Extended Cuff, Green, LG 15 bx $15.41Box/50 10 boxes $15.90BX 50No Bid $28.95Box 100

NeoPro EC Gloves, Chloroprene, Powder Free,  Extended Cuff, Green, MED 15 bx $15.41Box/50 10 boxes $15.90BX 50No Bid $28.95Box 100

NeoPro EC Gloves, Chloroprene, Powder Free,  Extended Cuff, Green, SM 15 bx $15.41Box/50 10 boxes $15.90BX 50No Bid $28.95Box 100

NeoPro EC Gloves, Chloroprene, Powder Free,  Extended Cuff, Green, XL 15 bx $15.41Box/50 10 boxes $15.90BX 50No Bid $28.95Box 100

Nitrile Exam Gloves, powder free textured - Large 100 bx. $19.51Box/100 10 boxes $26.49BX 100 $280.53cs 10bx/cs $0.110Each 1000 $10.25Each 100 $1,050.00 $10.50 $105.00 $11.350Box 100 $23.00Box 100 $18.79BX 100 $12.80Box 100

Nitrile Exam Gloves, powder free textured - Medium 100 bx. $19.51Box/100 10 boxes $26.49BX 100 $280.53cs 10bx/cs $0.110Each 1000 $10.25Each 100 $1,050.00 $10.50 $105.00 $11.350Box 100 $23.00Box 100 $18.79BX 100 $12.80

Nitrile Exam Gloves, powder free textured - Small 50 bx. $19.51Box/100 10 boxes $26.49BX 100 $280.53cs 10bx/cs $0.110Each 1000 $10.25Each 100 $525.00 $10.50 $105.00 $11.350Box 100 $23.00Box 100 $18.79BX 100 $12.80

Nitrile Exam Gloves, powder free textured Extra Large 75 bx. $19.51Box/100 10 boxes $26.49BX 90 $280.53cs 10bx/cs $0.110Each 1000 $10.25Each 100 $787.50 $10.50 $105.00 $11.350Box 100 $23.00Box 100 $18.79BX 100 $12.80

Ultrasense EC Exam Gloves - Small 10 bx. $26.69Box/100 10 boxes $26.35BX 100No Bid $29.00Box 100 $365.65CS 1000

Ultrasense EC Exam Gloves -Extra Large 20 bx. $26.69Box/100 10 boxes $26.35BX 100No Bid $29.00Box 100 $365.65CS 1000

Ultrasense EC Exam Gloves -Large 30 bx. $26.69Box/100 10 boxes $26.35BX 100No Bid $29.00Box 100 $365.65CS 1000

Ultrasense EC Exam Gloves -Medium 30 bx. $26.69Box/100 10 boxes $26.35BX 100No Bid $29.00Box 100 $365.65CS 1000

IV SUPPLIES

IV Catheters (Autoguard)

16 ga. 1.25” 50 ct. $110.80Box 50 $2.35EA 1 $123.78bx 50bx $116.90Box 50 $399.21CS 200

18 ga. 1.25” 250 ct. $105.00Box 50 $2.23EA 1 $123.78bx 50bx $117.30Box 50 $389.18CS 200

20 ga. 1.25” 350 ct. $105.00Box 50 $2.23EA 1 $123.78bx 50bx $105.00Box 50 $389.18CS 200

22 ga. 1.25” 100 ct. $105.00Box 50 $2.22EA 1 $123.78bx 50bx $153.60Box 50 $389.18CS 200

24 ga. 1.25” 50 ct. $105.00Box 50 $2.23EA 1 $123.78bx 50bx $133.20Box 50 $399.21CS 200

IV Catheters (Introcan)

14ga 1.25" 250 ct. $80.50Box 50 $1.73EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $646.35Case 200

16 ga. 1.25” 1000 ct. $1.59Each 200 $1.73EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $135.75Box 50

18 ga. 1.25” 1500 ct. $75.00Box 50 $1.73EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $133.40Box 50 $644.00CS 80

20 ga. 1.25” 500 ct. $1.50Each 200 $1.73EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $147.60Box 50 $644.00CS 80

22 ga. 1.25” 150 ct. $1.54Each 200 $1.73EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $135.75Box 50 $644.00CS 80

24 ga. 1.25” $1.61Each 200 $1.72EA 1 $125.00bx 50bx $125.00Box 50 $644.00CS 80

IV Catheters (Protect-IV)

16 ga. 1.25” 50 ct. $66.50Box 50 $1.49EA 1 $70.50bx 50bx $113.20Box 50 $399.21CS 200

18 ga. 1.25” 150 ct. $66.50Box 50 $1.49EA 1 $70.50bx 50bx $117.30Box 50 $389.18CS 200

20 ga. 1.25” 250 ct. $66.50Box 50 $1.49EA 1 $70.50bx 50bx $117.30Box 50 $389.18CS 200

22 ga. 1.25” 100 ct. $66.50Box 50 $1.49EA 1 $70.50bx 50bx $117.30Box 50 $389.18CS 200

24 ga. 1.25” 50 ct. $1.33Each 200 $1.49EA 1 $70.50bx 50bx $117.30Box 50 $399.21CS 200

IV Sets

15 gtt or 10 gtt primary IV  sets (Braun or Amsino) 1250 ct. $64.09Case 50 $0.94EA 1 $4.13ea $287.55Box 50 $105.34CS 20

60 gtt Primary IV sets (Braun or Amsino) 300 ct. $1.41Each 50 $0.73EA 1 $1.29ea $130.00Box 50 $317.40CS 100

Dial-flow Extension Sets (Amsino) 40 ct. $226.67Case 50 $2.34EA 1 $2.38ea $168.00Box 50

IV Extension locks 6” (Amsino) 3000 ct. $44.44Case 50 $1.42EA 1 $1.51ea $37.00Box 50

Needles & Syringes

1 cc Safety Syringe with 25 g needle 5/8" needle 200 ct. $17.58Box 100 $25.55BX 100No Bid $9.80Box 100 $77.99CS 800

18 ga. 1.5" Filter needles 500 ct. $14.60Box 100 $0.30EA 1 $290.85cs 10bx/cs $13.00Box 100 $42.34CS 1000

20 ga. x 1.25" needles 150 ct. $1.35Box 100 $0.05EA 1 $3.61bx 100bx $39.25Box 50 $38.53CS 1000

22 ga. x 1" needles 150 ct. $1.35Box 100 $4.38BX 100 $3.61bx 100bx $44.25Box 50 $45.54CS 1000

Lure tip 10 cc Safety Syringe with 21g 1” needle 200 ct. $19.34Box 50 $0.19EA 1No Bid $37.50Box 100 $59.05CS 400

Lure Tip 10mL syringe w/o needle 50 ea $7.56Box 100 $0.26EA 1 $8.19bx 100bx $12.45Box 100 $37.47CS 400

Lure Tip 20mL w/o syringe 50 ct $9.22Box 50 $0.75EA 1 $10.24bx 50bx $22.50Box 100 $49.93CS 192

Lure tip 3cc Safety Syringe with 22g 1” needle 250 ct. $17.15Box 100 $0.09EA 1No Bid $15.75Box 50 $56.47CS 800

Lure Tip 5mL syringe with needle 100 ct $7.67Box 100 $0.26EA 1No Bid $23.00Box 100 $54.41CS 400

Lure Tip 60mL w/o syringe 50 ct $8.50Box 25 $0.26EA 1 $10.84bx 25bx $10.00Box 25 $69.48CS 160

Mucosal Atomization Device (MAD) Nasal/Oral Latex Free 3 ML Syringe 250 ea $7.59Each 25 $6.78EA 1 $4.88ea $338.60Box 25 $304.96BX 25

NAR ARS Needle Decompression Kit 10ga 3.25in 10 ea $13.38Each $15.90EA 1 $15.35ea $22.50Each 1 $22.66EA 1

NAR ARS Needle Decompression Kit 14ga 3.25in 10 ea $7.27Each $9.25EA 1 $9.34ea $13.10Each 1 $12.06EA 1

Vial Access Canulas (BD) Twin Blunt 250 ct. $40.23Box 100 $0.34EA 1 $45.49bx 100bx $62.80Box 100 $260.46CS 1000

Normal Saline

100 ml Normal Saline IV Solution 150 ct. $2.30Each 96 $1.98EA 1No Bid $700.74CS 80

1000 ml Normal Saline IV Solution 1500 ct. $3.35Each 12 $3.12EA 1No Bid $104.17CS 14

250 ml Normal Saline IV Solution 150 ct. $3.21Each 24 $3.97EA 1No Bid $233.16CS 30

50 mL Sodium Chloride 0.9% ADD-Vantage Diluent Bags 30 ea $173.96Case 50 $177.94CS 96No Bid $210.54CS 50

Misc. IV Supplies

½ “ Transpore tape 100 rolls $12.05Box 24 $9.11BX 24 $3.86bx 24bx $16.78BX 24

1” Transpore tape 150 rolls $12.05Box 12 $31.89BX 100 $3.86bx 12bx $14.89BX 12

3 way stopcock 50 ct. $0.62Each 100 $0.88EA 1 $0.73ea $146.87CS 50

Alcohol preps 2000 ct. $1.19Box 200 $1.64BX 200 $1.57bx 200bx $2.69BX 100

IV start kit with Veni-Gard and alcohol prep pad 4000 ea $0.86Each 100 $1.12EA 1 $0.77ea $70.44CS 50

Latex Free Tourniquets (10/pk) 100 pk. $16.89Pack 250 $21.50BG 250 $0.96pk 10pk $24.27CS 100

Pressure IV Infuser Sleeve 25 ct. $32.95Box 5 $15.29EA 1 $8.01ea $60.32BX 5

Tegaderm Dressings (100/box) 25 bx $17.05Box 100 $0.66EA 1 $20.83bx 100bx $80.20BX 100

Swabflush Syringe Saline 10mL 25 bx $27.97Box 100 $82.99BX 100No Bid $58.28BX 100

Sharps Containers

Sharps Safe Tube, 1 1/2inch x 7inch, Red 500 ct. $1.22Each 24 $3.74EA 1 $1.13ea

SharpSafety In Room Sharps Container, 5qt, Transparent Red 20 ct. $4.06Each 20 $5.15EA 1 $4.49ea $71.96CS 20

MEDICATION:

Adenosine 6mg in 1ml 100 ea. $38.60Box 10 $23.60BX 10No Bid $27.77CS 10

Albuterol, 2.5mg, 0.83mg/ml, 3ml Vials, 25/Box 5 bx $3.44Carton 25 $3.16BX 25No Bid $3.90BX 25

Amidate, 40mg, 20ml Vial 30 ea. $58.66Box 10 $79.70BX 10No Bid $77.12EA 1

Amiodarone 150mg vials 75 ea. $48.00Box 10 $48.99PK 25No Bid $47.11CS 25

Aspirin, 81mg Chewable Tablets 300 ea. $0.87Bottle 36 $0.76BT 36No Bid $0.90EA 36

Atropen, 1mg/0.7ml Auto-Injector 30 ea.No Bid $7.21EA 1No Bid

Atropine, 1mg, 10ml LifeShield Prefilled Syringe 24 ea. $79.80Box 10 $127.11BX 10No Bid $150.00CS 10

Atropine, 8mg, 20ml Vial 20 ea. $500.30Box 10 $459.50BX 10No Bid $228.88CS 10

Calcium Chloride, 1gm, 10ml Luer Jet Prefilled Syringe 50 ea. $98.40Box 10 $114.70BX 10No Bid $130.00CS 10

Calcium Gluconate, 1gm, 10ml Vial 20 ea. $13.36Each $292.25PK 25No Bid $281.12CS 25

Cyanokit, 5gm Hydroxocobalamin, Contains 1 IV Admin set and 1 Transfer Spike 2 ea. $1,184.45Each $1,052.39EA 1No Bid $1,249.00EA 1

 Dexamethasone, 10mg/ml, 1ml Vial 75 ea. $41.25Pack 25 $47.25PK 25No Bid $41.11CS 25

Dextrose, 10%, in 250 ml and 0.9% saline 100 ea.No Bid $2.58EA 1No Bid

Dextrose, 25%, 2.5gm Prefilled Syringe 25 ea. $132.10Box 10 $147.80PK 10No Bid

Dextrose, 50%, 25gm, 50ml LifeShield Prefilled Syringe 50 ea. $129.38Box 10 $122.99BX 10No Bid

Diltiazem, 100mg, Add-Vantage Vial 30 ea. $140.30Pack 10 $131.99BX 10No Bid

Diltiazem, 100mg, 5ml Vial 30 ea. $35.70Box 10 No Bid No Bid

Diphenhydramine 50mg vial 100 ea. $28.00Box 25 $31.75PK 25No Bid $20.10CS 25

Duodote, Atropine 2.1mg / 0.7ml and Pralidoxime CHI 600mg / 2ml Auto-Injector 30 ea. $2,433.00Box 30 $2,289.99CS 30No Bid $1,753.36CS 30

Epinephrine, 1:1,000, 30mg, 30ml Vial 20 ea. $334.09Each $347.99EA 1No Bid $287.02EA 1

Epinephrine, 1:10,000, 1mg, 10ml, Luer 100 ea. $101.50Box 10 $97.90PK 10No Bid $63.30CS 10

Epipen Trainer, Auto-Injector Trainer 2 ea.No Bid $7.09EA 1No Bid $8.01EA 1

EpiPen, 0.15mg, 1:1,000 Auto-Injector, Junior, 2/Pack 20 ct. $302.87Pack 2 $429.99PK 2No Bid $277.12EA 2

EpiPen, 0.3mg, 1:1,000 Auto-Injector, 2/Pack 20 ct. $305.74Pack 2 $429.99PK 2No Bid $295.60EA 2

Glucagon 1mg vial 10 ea $223.39Each $172.99EA 1No Bid $196.57EA 1

Glutose, Single Unit Dose, 15gm 100 ct. $3.78Pack 3 $5.12EA 1 $1.65ea $13.49EA 3

Ipratropium Bromide, 0.02%, 2.5ml, Individually Wrapped, 30/Box 5 bx $6.21Box 30 $7.20BX 30No Bid $4.49BX 30

Ketorolac Vial, 30mg/mL, 1mL 25 ea. $29.00Box 25 $46.25BX 25No Bid $33.82EA 1

Labetaolol 20mg 10 ea $3.50Each $5.14EA 1No Bid $4.04EA 1

Levophed, 0.1%, 4mg, 4ml Ampule 30 ea. $103.10Box 10 $104.90BX 10No Bid $100.38BX 10

Lidocaine 100mg prefilled syringe 100 ea. $45.05Box 10 $45.91BX 10No Bid $39.70BX 10

Magnesium Sulfate 10gm in 2ml vial 50 ea. $2.25Each $58.99BX 25No Bid $48.50BX 25

Methylene Blue, 1%, 1ml Vial 20 ea.No Bid $2,262.99PK 10No Bid

Metoprolol 5mg vial 100 ea. $9.00Box 10 $17.90BX 10No Bid $3.02BX 25

Naloxone 2mg in 2ml prefilled luer lock syringe 100 ea. $236.90Box 10 $359.90CS 10No Bid

Nithiodote Kit, incl one Sodium Nitrite (300mg/10ml vial) and one Sodium Thiosulfate (12.5gm/50ml)2 ea.No Bid $274.99KT 1No Bid $207.78EA 1

Nitrostat, 0.4mg Sublingual Tablets, 25/Bottle 50 ea. $16.00Box of 4 bottles of 25 100 $89.99BT 100No Bid $13.96BT 25

Ondansetron, 4mg, 2ml Vial 100 ea. $9.75Box 25 $15.12BX 25No Bid $12.91EA 25

Ondansetron, 4mg ODT 100 ea. $2.87Pack 30 $4.76BX 30No Bid $2.50BT 30

Pyridoxine, 100mg, 1ml Vial 20 ea. $559.00Box 25 $662.99BX 25No Bid $464.88CS 25

Quelicin, 200mg, 10ml Vial 30 ea. $284.25Box 25 $749.75BX 25No Bid $40.20CS 10

Rocuronium 10mg in 10ml 20 ea. $54.60Box 10 $68.90BX 10No Bid $134.70CS 10

Sodium Bicarbonate, 8.4%, 50ml Vial Prefilled Syringe 200 ea. $158.50Box 10 $334.75BX 25No Bid $121.50CS 10

Sodium Nitrate, 300mg, 10ml Vial 2 ea.No Bid $27.79BX 25No Bid $108.78EA 1

Tetracaine, 0.5%, 15ml Bottle 50 ea. $8.87Each $131.99EA 1No Bid $76.94EA 1

Thiamine, 100mg/ml, 2ml Vial 20 ea. $225.50Box 25 $382.25PK 25No Bid $277.78BX 25

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES:

Assure® Prism Multi Blood Glucose Meter, 20-600mg/dL Meter Range 5 ea.No charge w/strip awardEach $8.79EA 1 $6.79ea $11.53EA 1

Assure® Prism Multi Control Solution 5 ea. $9.22Each $14.39BX 1 $13.49bx 2bx $16.81EA 1

Bath Towel, White 40in x 20in 200 eaNo Bid $1.95EA 1No Bid $25.65BX 12

Blanket, Disposable Yellow 60"x90" 100 ea $56.82Case 50 $89.99CS 20 $0.92ea $79.27CS 24

Clipboard 10 ea. $24.63Each 1 $22.49EA 1No Bid $3.09EA 1

Cold Pack Instant 5.5" x 10" Rapid Cold 10 ca $32.90Case 24 $28.49CS 24 $8.50cs 24cs $17.53CS 24

Convenience Bag (BioHoop) 250 ct. $14.13Box 12 $10.20PK 12 $21.97pk 12pk $27.13CS 12

Disposable Bedpan 25 ct. $0.99Each 50 $1.11EA 1 $1.15ea $43.88CS 20

Disposable Male Urinal 25 ct. $18.16Case 48 $2.14EA 1 $1.28ea $1.02EA 1

Disposable wash basin (6 quart) 25 ct. $0.69Each 1 $0.77EA 1 $0.68ea $94.10CS 50

Emesis Basin (500cc) 100 ct. $2.70Box 25 $0.14EA 1 $0.12ea $0.16EA 1

Extra Safety Lancets (Unistik or Genie) 500 ct. $4.33Box 100 $17.29BX 100 $21.45bx 100bx $22.69BX 100

Eye Wash (4oz) 25 ct. $1.82Each $3.13EA 1 $2.57ea $2.36EA 1

Flashlight, Survivor LED, with AC/DC, Orange 5 ea.No Bid $154.99EA 1No Bid $196.68EA 1

GlucometerAssure Prism Multi Blood Glucose Test Strips (50/bx) 60 bx.$9.79 Box 50 $13.99BX 50$11.55 bx 50bx $78.45BX 50

Hot Pack Instant 5.5" x 10" Rapid Heat 5 box$34.20 Case 24 $31.49CS 24$29.80 cs 24cs $31.26CS 24

Kelly Forceps 7” Curved 10 ct.$1.46 Each $1.31EA 1$0.74 ea $12.17EA 1

Light sticks 50 ea.No Bid $22.88CS 36No Bid $16.28BX 10

Magill Forceps - Large 10 ct.$3.50 Each $3.70EA 1$3.88 ea $214.06EA 1

Magill Forceps - Small 10 ct.$3.41 Each $3.70EA 1$3.88 ea $214.06EA 1

Morgan Lens 10 ea.$31.92 Each $34.85EA 1$10.79 bx 1bx $50.77EA 1

Morgan Lens drip set 20 ea.$10.18 Each $68.45BX 6$33.97 ea $16.42EA 1

NAR Combat Application Tourniquet (CAT) Black, One-handed Tourniquet 25 ea $21.29Each $25.95EA 1 $23.33ea $30.03EA 1

Numbered 9" breakable seals 3000 ct. $16.09Pack 100 $27.25PK 1 $40.35pk 100pk $30.89BX 100

Prep Razors (Gallant) 300 ct. $15.33Pack 50 $0.60EA 1 $18.05bx 50bx $23.13BX 50

Ready-Heat II 12 panel Disp. Blanket 34"x48" 50 ea No Bid $23.49EA 1 No Bid $21.97EA 1

Ring cutter 5 ea. $4.92Each $13.49EA 1 $4.87ea $46.51EA 1

Rite in the Rain Notebook Pad 200 ct. No Bid $5.49EA 1 No Bid $0.00

Scalpel #10 20 ct. $0.38Each 10 $8.99BX 10 $4.59bx 10bx $1.59EA 1

Seat Belt Cutters 10 ea. $3.13Each $6.29EA 1 $0.81ea $2.29EA 1

Soft limb restraint 10 ea. $3.00Pair $29.79DZ 12 $3.62ea $3.91EA 1

Space Rescue Blankt Mylar Foil 84"x52" 100 ea $0.41Each 250 $0.72EA 1 $0.37ea $193.37CS 250

Disposable Ear Plugs 2 bx $23.77Box 200 $36.99BX 200 No Bid $23.99BX 200

Sterile Saline 0.9% for irrigation - 250cc 125 ct. $34.91Case 24 $8.89BX 24 No Bid $43.33CS 24

Sterile Saline 0.9% for irrigation - 500cc 15 ct. $31.97Case 18 $9.19BX 24 No Bid $47.52CS 18

Sterile Water for irrigation - 1000cc 15 ct. $10.97Case 6 $44.70BX 25 No Bid $20.75CS 6

Sterile Water for irrigation - 250cc 125 ct. $34.07Case 24 $44.70BX 25 No Bid $43.33CS 24

Sterile Water for irrigation - 500cc 30 ct. $31.23Case 18 $44.70BX 25 No Bid $47.52CS 18

Tarp - 10x10 disposable 25 ea. No Bid No Bid No Bid $69.84EA 1

T-POD 5 ct. No Bid $105.99EA 1 $97.56ea $134.45EA 1

Trauma Shears (Various Colors) 100 ct. $0.62Each 200 $0.78EA 1 $0.74ea $10.95EA 1

Spit Sock Hood 10 ea. $2.16Each 100 $3.12EA 1 No Bid $4.95EA 1

IV Fluid Warmer

Smithworks IV Fluid Warmer with Soft Sack, 3 Liter 5 ea $554.78Each $519.99EA 1 $487.80ea $660.85EA 1

Training Supplies

Adult Q-CPR Manikins, 4 pack (Laerdal) 4 ct. $831.82Pack 4 $916.00EA 1 $938.46ea $1,143.16PK 4

AED Trainer (multiple brands desired) 4 ct. $343.29Each $2,159.99EA 1 No Bid $646.48EA 1

Infant Q-CPR Manikins, 4 pack (Laerdal ) 4 ct. $792.59Pack 4 $776.00EA 1 $870.19ea $1,060.05PK 4

One Way Valve, Replacement, for Pocket Style CPR Mask 100 ct. $6.95Each $1.04EA 1 $3.92ea $20.53EA 1

MCI Supplies

The Smart Commander Kits with Command Board 2 ea. No Bid $214.99EA 1 No Bid

Smart Tags Triage System, 10/PK 10 ea. No Bid $19.49PK 10 No Bid $30.53PK 10

Smart Triage Pac, Standard Specification, Contains Smart Pediatric Tape 5 ea. No Bid $173.99EA 1 No Bid $288.35EA 1

PATIENT ASSESSMENT AND EXAM SUPPLIES

Latex Free BP Cuffs (standard w/sphyg):

Adult Large 15 ct. $5.50Each $7.95EA 1 $7.23ea $29.85EA 1

Adult Regular 25 ct. $5.17Each $7.11EA 1 $6.19ea $25.90EA 1

Child 15 ct. $5.12Each $7.95EA 1 $7.14ea $25.81EA 1

Infant 15 ct. $5.12Each $7.95EA 1 $7.69ea $23.63EA 1

Penlights (6 per pack) 50 pk. $3.71Pack 6 $4.24PK 6 $4.17pk 6pk $10.78PK 6

Stethoscope - Acoustic varied colors (Adscope Adult 603) 25 ct. $28.92Each $32.99EA 1 $10.68ea $38.18EA 1

Stethoscope - Acoustic varied colors (Adscope Pediatric 604) 15 ct. $30.99Each $18.44PR 1 $33.47ea $52.90EA 1

SureTemp Plus 690 Electronic Thermometer 5 ea. $257.73Each $94.99EA 1 $291.95ea $284.43EA 1
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